
ITEM NO. MODEL/TYPE
YEAR OF 

PRODUCTION

BIDDERS MODEL & 

DESCRIPTION

PRICE PER 

DAY

PRICE PER 

MILE

LEASE TAX (IF 

APPLICABLE)

YEAR OF 

PRODUCTION

BIDDERS MODEL & 

DESCRIPTION

PRICE PER 

DAY

PRICE PER 

MILE

LEASE TAX (IF 

APPLICABLE)

1
20' BOX 

TRUCK
$85.00 $.18 /MI N/A

DO NOT HAVE IN FLEET 

(NO BID)
$______/DAY $______/MI NA

2
TRUCK, PICK-

UP
$80.00 $.25 /MI N/A

DO NOT HAVE IN FLEET 

(NO BID)
$______/DAY $______/MI NA

3 CARGO VAN $68.00 $.25 /MI N/A 2018-2022

DODGE PROMASTER 

MERCEDES BENZ 2500 

FORD TRANSIT

$125.95 $.19 /MI 2.5%

4

15' BOX 

TRUCK 

W/POWER 

LIFTGATE 

$85.00 $.18 /MI N/A 2017-2022
CHEVROLET /ISUZU 

LCF4500D
$125.95 $.19 /MI 2.5%

5
24' BOX 

TRUCK
$95.00 $.18 /MI N/A 2017-2022

INTL -MV 607 

FREIGHTLINER M2106 
$160.95 $.19 /MI 2.5%

ITB #21-23 "TRUCK RENTALS (VARIOUS SIZES)"

Ericka Andrew, Buyer

Bid Tabulation

DESCRIPTION

FUEL TYPE: Regular

Mpg: 7 to 9

Tank Size: 34-gal.

Seats: 3 

Interior Length: 19’10” Interior 

Width: 7’10” Interior Height: 

7’0” Empty Weight: 8,600 Max 

Load: 4000 Gross Vehicle 

Weight (GVW): 14,500

1

EAN SERVICES, LLC

823.00$                                                                                                                                                                             

Commodity Code: 97514

Email: andrewe@jccal.org

TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID

FUEL TYPE: Regular

Mpg: 14 to 16

Tank Size: 35-gal.

Seats: 2 

Interior Length: 9'9” Interior 

Width: 6’1” Interior Height: 

4’6” Empty Weight: 4,800 Max 

Load: 1000 Gross Vehicle 

Weight (GVW): 6,700

FUEL TYPE: Regular

Mpg: 14 to 16

Tank Size: 26-gal.

Seats: 3 

Interior Length: 8’1” Interior 

Width: 5’2” Interior Height: 

1’8” Empty Weight: 4,600 Max 

Load: 1,000 Gross Vehicle 

Weight (GVW): 6,400

FUEL TYPE: Regular

Mpg: 7 to 9

Tank Size: 34-gal.

Seats: 3 

Interior Length: 14’11” Interior 

Width: 7’10” Interior Height: 

7’2” Empty Weight: 7,600 Max 

Load: 3000 Gross Vehicle 

Weight (GVW): 12,000

FUEL TYPE: Diesel

Mpg: 7 to 9

Tank Size: 100-gal.

Seats: 3 

Interior Length: 23’7” Interior 

Width: 8’1” Interior Height: 

8’1” Empty Weight: 16,150 

Max Load: 8000 Gross Vehicle 

Weight (GVW): 25,950

2

RYDER TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

                                                                                 NON-CDL REQUIRED TRUCKS

579.80$                                                                                                                                                           
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1

EAN SERVICES, LLC

2

RYDER TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

6

24' TRUCK, 

FLATBED W/ 

POWER 

LIFTGATE 

(RAILS 

OPT'L)

$105.00 $.18 /MI N/A
DO NOT HAVE IN FLEET 

(NO BID)
$______/DAY $______/MI NA

ITEM NO. MODEL/TYPE
YEAR OF 

PRODUCTION

BIDDERS MODEL & 

DESCRIPTION

PRICE PER 

DAY

PRICE PER 

MILE

LEASE TAX (IF 

APPLICABLE)

YEAR OF 

PRODUCTION

BIDDERS MODEL & 

DESCRIPTION

PRICE PER 

DAY

PRICE PER 

MILE

LEASE TAX (IF 

APPLICABLE)

7

22' TO 26" 

FOOT 

FLATBED 

TRUCK (CDL)

$105.00 $.18 /MI N/A
DO NOT HAVE IN FLEET 

(NO BID)
$______/DAY $______/MI NA

8

24' TO 26" 

FOOT 

FLATBED 

TRUCK (CDL)

$105.00 $.18 /MI N/A
DO NOT HAVE IN FLEET 

(NO BID)
$______/DAY $______/MI NA

9

22' TO 26" 

FOOT BOX 

TRUCK (CDL)

$95.00 $.18 /MI N/A 2017 TO 2022

INTL -MV 607 GVWR 

33,000 FREIGHTLINER 

M2106 GVWR 33,000

$166.95 $.19 /MI NA

1

2

                                                                                                                           CDL REQUIRED TRUCKS

Delivery is guaranteed no later than  30  days after order dateDelivery is guaranteed no later than  7  days after order date

DESCRIPTION

FUEL TYPE: Diesel

Mpg: 9 to 13

Tank Size: 70-gal.

Seats: 2-3 

Interior Length: 23’7” Interior 

Width: 8’1” Interior Height: 

8’1” Empty Weight: 16,150 

Max Load: 8000 Gross Vehicle 

Weight (GVW): 25,950

FUEL TYPE: Diesel

Mpg: 9 to 13

Tank Size: 70-gal.

Seats: 2-3 

Adjustable Cargo Straps 

Forklift Package Max Load: 

18,000 Gross Vehicle Weight 

(GVW): 33,000

FUEL TYPE: Diesel

Mpg: 9 to 13

Tank Size: 70-gal.

Seats: 2-3 

Adjustable Cargo Straps 

Forklift Package/Rear roll-up 

Door /Floor Height: 46-50 in. 

Max Load: 17,000 Gross 

Vehicle Weight (GVW): 33,000

FUEL TYPE: Diesel

Mpg: 7 to 9

Tank Size: 35-gal.

Seats: 3; 12-Pallets 

Bed Length: 25'4”  Bed Width: 

7’7” Rail Height: 3’6” Empty 

Weight: 4,800 Max Load: 8000 

YES

YES

YES

REQUIRED FORMS

Notification of Intent to Respond

Non-Collusion Affidavit

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

NO

YES

YES

YES

YES

Bid Form

Affidavit of Contractor

Equal Employment Opportunity Certification Form

Debarment Statement

Signature Page

NO

VENDOR: EAN SERVICES LLC | ADDRESS: 600 CORPORATE PARK DRIVE ST. LOUIS, MO 63102| CONTACT: MATTHEW MORRISON PH: 314-512-5000

VENDOR: RYDER TRANSPORTATION SERVICES | ADDRESS: 4200 VANDERBILT ROAD BIRMINGHAM, AL 35217| CONTACT: SCOTT BUTLER PH:256-617-2909

CONTACT INFORMATION

YES

NO

NO

Amendment No. 1

Specification Sheet

Bid Bond

NO

YES
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